Kenya Subsidiary Legislation, 1992

919

Lecar Notice No. 442
THE STAMP DUTY ACT
(Cap. 480)

EXEMPTION

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 106 of
the Stamp Duty Act, the Vice-President and Minister for Finance
directs that the instruments executed in respect of the increase
in the authorized share capital of the National Bank of Kenya
Limited from Kenya Shillings one hundred and sixty million
(XSh. 160,000,000) to Kenya Shillings seven hundred and ﬁfty
million (KSh. 750,000,000) shall be exempt from the provisions
of the Act.

Dated the 17th December, 1992.

GEORGE SAITOTI,
Vice-President and Minister for Finance.

LeoAL Nortic No. 443
THE BANKING ACT

(Cap. 488)

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 7 (2)
of the Banking Act, the Vice-President and Minister for Finance
makes the following Order:—

THE BANKING (AMENDMENT OF FIRST SCHEDULE) :
ORDER, 1992

1. This Order may be cited as the Banking (Amendment
of First Schedule) Order, 1992.

2. The First Schedule to the Act is amended—

(@) in paragraph (a), by deleting the expression “ﬁfteen
million” and inserting “seventy-five million®;

(b) in paragraph (b), by deleting the expression “one
hundred and fifty million” and inserting “two hundred
million”;

(c) in paragraph (c), by deleting the expression “seven
million five hundred thousand shillings” and inserting
“thirty-seven million five hundred thousand shillings”;
and

(d) in paragraph (d), by deleting the expressmn “seventy-
five million shillings” and inserting “one hundred and
fifty million shillings®.

Made on the 17th December, 1992.

GEORGE SAITOTI,
Vice-President and Minister for Finance.



